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Abstract  

Multidimensional poverty measurement (MPI) offers a more comprehensive framework for understanding poverty, as it includes various 
non-income dimensions such as education, health, and living standards. Traditional poverty measures, typically based on income 
thresholds, fail to capture the full spectrum of deprivation experienced by the poor. This systematic review examines key MPI 
methodologies, focusing on the widely used Alkire-Foster method and the Human Development Index, and explores how they are 
applied in different regional contexts. The review evaluates both the strengths and limitations of these approaches, including challenges 
related to indicator selection, weighting, and data availability. Furthermore, it discusses the policy implications of adopting MPI in 
national and global anti-poverty strategies, highlighting how MPI can offer policymakers more precise insights into the multidimensional 
nature of poverty. By synthesizing findings from recent empirical studies, this paper aims to contribute to the ongoing discourse on 
refining poverty measurement tools to better inform policy interventions and enhance poverty alleviation efforts globally. The review 
underscores the potential of MPI to address the shortcomings of unidimensional approaches and its importance in formulating more 
targeted, effective poverty reduction strategies. 

Keywords: Multidimensional Poverty, Alkire-Foster Method, Human Development Index, Poverty Measurement, Policy 
Development. 

 

Introduction 

Child Poverty remains one of the most pressing global challenges of the 21st century. Traditionally, it 
has been defined in economic terms, relying on income thresholds to assess who is poor. For instance, 
the World Bank has long used an international poverty line currently set at $1.90 per day to categorize 
individuals living in poverty (Vollmer & Alkire, 2022). While these income-based metrics have been 
useful for identifying large-scale poverty trends, they fail to capture the full complexity of the issue. 
Income alone cannot reflect the multiple dimensions of deprivation faced by poor populations, such 
as inadequate access to education, poor health, or substandard living conditions (Bastos & Machado, 
2018). 

In response to these limitations, the concept of multidimensional poverty has gained traction in recent 
years. This approach shifts away from a singular focus on income, instead recognizing that poverty 
encompasses multiple deprivations that affect people’s ability to live dignified lives. The shift towards 
multidimensional poverty measurement (MPI) reflects a growing understanding that human well -being 
depends on more than just material wealth. This perspective is deeply influenced by Amartya Sen’s 
capability approach, which argues that poverty should be understood as a deprivation of basic 
capabilities necessary to achieve a fulfilling life (Sen, 2017). Sen's work emphasized that poverty is not 
just about a lack of income, but about the inability to lead a life of value. 

Various tools have been developed to operationalize the concept of multidimensional poverty. One 
of the earliest and most widely recognized is the Human Development Index (HDI), introduced by 
the United Nations Development Programme (UNDP) in 1990. The HDI combines three key 
dimensions life expectancy, education, and income into a single composite measure of well -being 
(UNDP, 2020) However, despite its widespread use, the HDI has faced criticism for being too 
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simplistic and for failing to account for other critical dimensions of poverty, such as social exclusion, 
environmental conditions, or access to public services (Liu & Xu, 2016). 

To address these limitations, scholars have developed more comprehensive tools such as the Alkire-
Foster (AF) method. Developed by Sabina Alkire and James Foster, the AF method allows for a more 
flexible and nuanced assessment of poverty by identifying individuals or households that are deprived 
in multiple dimensions (Alkire & Foster, 2011). Unlike income-based measures or even the HDI, the 
AF method can disaggregate poverty into specific dimensions such as health, education, and living 
standards and quantify both the extent and intensity of deprivation. This multidimensional approach 
enables policymakers to design more targeted interventions by revealing not just how many people are 
poor, but in what ways they are poor (Alkire & Kanagaratnam, 2021). 

The Alkire-Foster method has been applied in a wide range of contexts, from global poverty 
assessments to national poverty reduction strategies. For example, the Global Multidimensional 
Poverty Index (MPI), which uses the AF method, has been adopted by many countries to track 
multidimensional poverty over time. The MPI considers a range of deprivations, such as child 
mortality, years of schooling, and access to clean water, making it a more comprehensive tool for 
assessing poverty in its many forms (Alkire & Kanagaratnam, 2021). In regions like Latin America and 
Sub-Saharan Africa, where traditional income-based measures often overlook critical aspects of 
deprivation, the MPI has provided invaluable insights into the nature and scope of poverty (Santos & 
Villatoro, 2020). 

However, the application of multidimensional poverty measurement is not without challenges. One 
major issue is the selection of dimensions and indicators. While some dimensions, such as health and 
education, are universally recognized as essential for well-being, others may be more context specific. 
For instance, access to digital services like the internet might be considered a basic need in one country 
but not in another (Santos & Villatoro, 2020). Moreover, the choice of indicators and the process of 
assigning weights to different dimensions can significantly influence the outcomes of the analysis. The 
lack of a universal standard for these choices makes comparisons between countries difficult 
(Espinoza-Delgado & Klasen, 2018). 

Another challenge is the availability and quality of data, especially in low-income or conflict-affected 
regions where data collection is limited. The accuracy and reliability of multidimensional poverty 
measures depend heavily on the availability of high-quality, disaggregated data that captures 
deprivations across various dimensions (Bastos & Machado, 2018). In some cases, governments may 
lack the resources or infrastructure to collect such data, resulting in incomplete or biased poverty 
assessments. Addressing these data challenges is crucial for improving the accuracy and effectiveness 
of multidimensional poverty measures. 

Despite these challenges, the adoption of multidimensional poverty measurement offers significant 
advantages. Unlike traditional poverty measures, which tend to focus on income or consumption, MPI 
provides a more comprehensive understanding of poverty. It enables policymakers to identify not only 
how many people are poor but also the specific dimensions in which they are deprived. This 
information is critical for designing targeted interventions that address the root causes of poverty. For 
example, if a significant portion of the population is deprived in education but not in income, then 
policy interventions should prioritize improving access to quality education rather than merely 
increasing household income (Alkire & Kanagaratnam, 2021). 

Moreover, multidimensional poverty measures can reveal inequalities within countries and regions that 
are often masked by national averages. By disaggregating data at the regional or household level, MPI 
can highlight disparities in poverty levels across different population groups, such as rural versus urban 
areas, or by gender and age. This level of detail is crucial for designing equitable poverty reduction 
strategies that address the needs of marginalized or vulnerable groups (Espinoza-Delgado & Klasen, 
2018). 

https://ecohumanism.co.uk/joe/ecohumanism
https://doi.org/10.62754/joe.v3i8.5041


Journal of Ecohumanism 

 2024 
Volume: 3, No: 8, pp. 3879 – 3891 

ISSN: 2752-6798 (Print) | ISSN 2752-6801 (Online) 
https://ecohumanism.co.uk/joe/ecohumanism  

DOI: https://doi.org/10.62754/joe.v3i8.5041  

3881 

 

This paper provides a systematic review of the methodologies used in multidimensional poverty 
measurement, with a focus on recent empirical studies applying the AF method and other MPI 
frameworks. It aims to assess the strengths and limitations of these approaches and explore their policy 
implications. By synthesizing findings from recent literature, this review seeks to contribute to ongoing 
discussions about improving poverty measurement tools to better inform policy interventions and 
enhance global poverty alleviation efforts. 

 

Methodology 

This section outlines the methodological approach taken in conducting the systematic review on 
multidimensional poverty measurement. The aim of this review is to synthesize and critically evaluate 
the different methods applied in the literature to assess multidimensional poverty, with a particular 
focus on the use of the Alkire-Foster (AF) method and other MPI frameworks. The review follows a 
structured approach to ensure that relevant studies are systematically identified, assessed, and 
synthesized. 

Search Strategy 

The systematic review adhered to the PRISMA (Preferred Reporting Items for Systematic Reviews 
and Meta-Analyses) guidelines to ensure comprehensive coverage of the literature (Page et al., 2021). 
A search of Scopus databases was conducted to identify peer-reviewed articles published between 2015 
and 2024. The search terms included combinations of the following keywords: multidimensional 
poverty measurement, Alkire-Foster method, capability approach, poverty indices, global 
multidimensional poverty index (MPI), and poverty measurement frameworks. Additional terms such 
as household poverty, income and capability deprivations, and poverty alleviation strategies were used 
to broaden the scope of the search, ensuring a diverse representation of methodologies and 
perspectives in the field (Burchi et al., 2022). 

To systematically identify relevant literature on multidimensional poverty measurement, a 
comprehensive search strategy was developed utilizing a structured search string. The search string 
was designed to encompass a wide range of terms related to multidimensional poverty and its 
measurement methodologies. Specifically, the search string was formulated as follows: Title-Abs-
Key((“multidimensional poverty index” OR “multidimensional poverty measurement” OR “Alkire 
Foster method” OR “capability approach” OR “poverty indices” OR “MPI” OR “poverty 
measurement” OR “deprivation”) AND (“poverty indicator*” OR “poverty dimension” OR “poverty 
assessment” OR “socioeconomic indicator”)). 

This search string incorporates various keywords and phrases that reflect the key concepts in the field 
of multidimensional poverty measurement. The first set of terms focuses on the core concept of 
multidimensional poverty, including its definitions and measurement frameworks. The second set of 
terms captures the various indicators, dimensions, and methodological approaches employed in 
poverty assessment. To further refine the search, filters were applied to limit studies to empirical 
research, policy papers, and literature reviews written in English. Studies focusing on case studies, 
regional assessments, and global applications of multidimensional poverty were prioritized to capture 
a wide range of methodologies and contexts. Reference lists of selected articles were also screened to 
identify additional relevant studies not captured in the initial search.  

Inclusion and Exclusion Criteria 

The inclusion criteria for this systematic review were carefully established to ensure the relevance and 
quality of selected studies on multidimensional poverty measurement, as suggested in prior studies 
(Alkire & Kanagaratnam, 2021). Table 1 outlines the inclusion and exclusion criteria used in the 
methodology for study selection. In terms of literature type, systematic review journals, books, book 
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series, book chapters, and conference proceedings were excluded, aligning with similar methodological 
approaches to focus on empirical studies that provide original and rigorous data or case studies. 

This study emphasizes empirical articles that focus on multidimensional poverty, which are more likely 
to offer detailed quantitative data or case studies essential for in-depth analysis. Only English-language 
publications were included, a choice consistent with standard practice in systematic reviews to avoid 
translation complexities and because English is the predominant language in scholarly databases, which 
has been highlighted as a common inclusion criterion in similar research efforts (Page et al., 2021). 
Consequently, studies published in languages other than English were excluded to maintain 
consistency, accessibility, and comparability of the sources included in this review.  

Table 1. Inclusion and Exclusion Criteria 

Criterion Eligibility Exclusion 

Literature type 
 
 
Language 
Timeline 
Research Areas 
 
Countries/Region 

Provide empirical data or case 
studies on multidimensional 
poverty 
English. 
Between 2015 to 2024 
Business Economics or Social 
Sciences. 
Developing Countries 

Systematic review journal, book, 
book series, chapter in book, 
conference proceeding 
Non-English 
< 2015 
Other areas 
 
Non-Developing Countries 

Furthermore, studies published between 2015 and 2024 are included to focus on recent findings and 
developments in the field, ensuring relevance to current contexts. The review focuses on studies within 
the fields of Business Economics and Social Sciences, as these areas are directly related to poverty 
studies and social determinants. Studies that provide empirical data or case studies on 
multidimensional poverty in developing countries are included, as these regions often experience 
significant poverty issues and are the primary focus of the review 

Data Extraction 

To conduct the systematic review on multidimensional poverty measurement, a structured data 
extraction form was developed to systematically collect relevant information from each study, which 
aligns with best practices as highlighted in previous literature (Burchi et al., 2022). Key extracted data 
included authors' names, year of publication, and the geographical region of the study, providing a 
contextual understanding of poverty metrics across diverse regions (Alkire & Kanagaratnam, 2021). 
Additionally, methodological approaches such as the use of the Alkire-Foster method or other 
multidimensional techniques were recorded, along with the specific dimensions and indicators of 
poverty (education, health, and living standards) and the weighting schemes applied to these 
dimensions, following criteria discussed in recent studies. 

Further, the extracted data included poverty measurement results, disaggregated by demographics such 
as rural or urban classifications, gender, and age, to ensure a nuanced analysis of poverty across 
population groups. Policy implications derived from the findings were also documented, capturing 
recommendations for addressing multidimensional poverty, as noted by (Burchi et al., 2022). Data 
extraction was independently performed by two reviewers, and any discrepancies were resolved by 
discussion or a third reviewer, which is in line with the standard review processes to minimize bias 
(Page et al., 2021). 

For quality assessment, the systematic review methodology was bolstered by bibliometric analysis to 
rigorously evaluate studies on multidimensional poverty measurement. This approach supports 
evidence-based decision-making by consolidating scientific knowledge and generating well-supported 
insights for policymaking, which has been emphasized by recent studies (Burchi et al., 2022). A two-
reviewer system, with reliability checks, was used to uphold consistency and rigor in evaluating studies.  
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The PRISMA framework was adopted to structure the systematic review, offering guidance for 
organizing reports and enhancing clarity and reproducibility (Page et al., 2021). During the initial phase, 
PRISMA criteria for inclusion, search strategies, and study selection processes were applied, 
particularly within the Scopus database. Targeted keywords included multidimensional poverty 
measurement and related terms, ensuring comprehensive coverage of relevant studies from 2015 to 
2024. This search strategy aligns with methods previously documented in poverty measurement 
reviews. 

Following eligibility criteria, 14 studies were selected for analysis, divided into two categories. The first 
focused on bibliometric analysis, including annual scientific production, keyword frequency, and 
country distribution. This included data organization through MS Excel and VOS viewer soft ware for 
visualization. The second category, content analysis, provided detailed insights into methodological 
choices and tools used in multidimensional poverty measurement, highlighting factors influencing 
measurement outcomes (Vollmer & Alkire, 2022). This dual classification enables a structured and 
comprehensive understanding of the current research landscape on multidimensional poverty 
measurement, offering valuable insights into policy and intervention strategies tailored to poverty 
alleviation. 

Analytical Approach 

After identifying the relevant studies and extracting the necessary data, a thematic analysis was 
performed to uncover recurring themes and patterns in the application of multidimensional poverty 
measures. Thematic coding was utilized to categorize the studies based on key aspects of the 
Multidimensional Poverty Index (MPI), which included the selection of dimensions examining how 
various studies choose poverty dimensions based on either international standards such as the 
Sustainable Development Goals (SDGs) or context-specific factors; indicator choices analyzing the 
specific indicators employed to assess deprivations within each dimension; weighting schemes 
evaluating how different studies assign weights to dimensions, whether through equal weighting or 
context-specific approaches; and policy relevance considering how the results from multidimensional 
poverty measurements can inform or influence policy decisions, particularly in the formulation of 
poverty reduction strategies. The analysis also looked at regional differences in the application of MPI, 
comparing results from low-income countries, middle-income countries, and high-income countries 
to identify context-specific trends. 

Limitations of the Methodology 

While this review aims to provide a comprehensive synthesis of the literature on multidimensional 
poverty measurement, there are several limitations to note. First, the review only included articles 
written in English, which may exclude relevant studies published in other languages. Second, the 
reliance on peer-reviewed journal articles may have excluded valuable insights from gray literature, 
such as reports by non-governmental organizations (NGOs) or policy briefs by international agencies. 
Finally, the focus on studies published between 2015 and 2024, while capturing recent developments, 
may have overlooked earlier foundational work in the field. 

Results and Analysis 

This section presents the findings from a systematic review and bibliometric analysis on 
multidimensional poverty measurement (MPI), offering insights into trends, thematic focuses, and 
regional applications. The analysis is segmented into bibliometric, content, and regional application 
reviews. The bibliometric analysis highlights publication trends, influential authors, and citation 
patterns in 351 MPI literature. Showing consistent growth in publications from 2015 to 2024, 
indicative of the increasing academic and policy-driven interest in multidimensional frameworks 
especially in response to global issues like the COVID-19 pandemic (D’Attoma & Matteucci, 2024). 
The most cited works in this field address topics such as energy poverty, health inequities,  and spatial 
poverty mapping, emphasizing the diverse dimensions of deprivation (Pérez Gelves et al., 2023). 
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The content analysis investigates common methodologies, with a particular focus on the widely utilized 
Alkire-Foster method. It identifies frequently used dimensions such as health, education, and living 
standards, while also noting variations in weighting schemes and indicators, reflecting adaptations to 
capture poverty’s complex nature effectively (Chen et al., 2019). A critical comparison of 
methodologies showcases the MPI framework’s flexibility but also its limitations in addressing 
poverty’s full complexity across contexts. 

Finally, regional applications highlight the diverse implementations of MPI across Latin America, Sub-
Saharan Africa, and South Asia, revealing substantial regional differences in poverty manifestations. 
This section discusses the challenges these regions face, such as data scarcity and selecting contextually 
relevant indicators, which can impede precise poverty measurement. Despite these obstacles, MPI 
applications have provided valuable guidance for formulating targeted poverty alleviation policies 
tailored to regional needs (Zhang et al., 2022). 

Bibliometric Analysis 

Bibliometric analysis is a quantitative approach used to evaluate academic literature, highlighting 
patterns, trends, and impacts within a research domain. For this systematic review on Multidimensional 
Poverty Measurement (MPI), we employed tools such as VOS viewer and Microsoft Excel to map and 
visualize trends in publication volume, keyword co-occurrences, and citation networks from a curated 
dataset of research papers published between 2015 and 2024. Results of the bibliometric analysis 
illustrate a rising interest in MPI methodologies, with the Alkire-Foster (AF) method gaining particular 
traction across various regions and research fields (Smith et al., 2021). This analysis provides insights 
into leading authors, influential countries, and evolving research themes, while also exposing gaps in 
MPI applications that could be addressed by future studies. 

Figure 1. Annual Scientific Production of the Studies 

 

The analysis also shows an expanding focus on the policy implications of MPI, particularly regarding 
how this framework informs targeted poverty alleviation strategies (Chen et al., 2019). Highly cited 
papers in the field often address innovations in MPI methods, country-specific poverty assessments, 
and adaptations of the Alkire-Foster method to local contexts (Zhang et al., 2022). Figure 1 reveals an 
upward trend in MPI-related publications, particularly after 2020, correlating with the global adoption 
of the Sustainable Development Goals (SDGs) and the SDG 1 aim to “end poverty in all its forms 
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everywhere” (UNDP, 2020). This annual production data, captured from 2015-2024, shows a marked 
increase in publications from 2018 onwards, peaking with around 40 articles in 2021. This period aligns 
with a broader global push towards comprehensive poverty reduction strategies and growing interest 
in multidimensional poverty frameworks due to socioeconomic challenges highlighted by the COVID-
19 pandemic (Wang et al., 2023). 

The fluctuation in research output post-2021 may indicate a shift in focus towards more specialized 
or regional studies, or it may reflect an evolution in the field where key foundational research has 
already been published. Additionally, the rise of machine learning and big data as tools for poverty 
measurement may be influencing the types of publications and methodologies used during this period. 
2015 to 2021 represents the most prolific period for research on multidimensional poverty 
measurement, likely driven by heightened international development goals and a push for more holistic 
approaches to poverty alleviation. During this time, there was a concerted effort by scholars and 
policymakers to develop frameworks that go beyond income-based poverty measures, incorporating 
dimensions such as education, health, and living standards. 

Table 2. Scientific Production by Authors and Countries 

Rank Author Country 
Countries' Scientific 

Production 

1 Sabina Alkire USA 267 

2 Allel Kasim UK 197 

3 Hans-Jürgen Andreß  China 98 

4 Gaia Bertarelli Italy 94 

5 Gianni Betti  Spain 79 

6 Bahman Cheraghian France 72 

7 Caterina Giusti Brazil 55 

8 Su-Jung Nam Canada 40 

9 Geranda Notten India 39 

10 Yanhui Wang Germany 34 

Most prolific authors and countries identify the authors or countries with the highest number of 
articles. By analyzing the authors' contributions, we will provide insights into leading researchers in 
the field of multidimensional. Table 2 outlines the top authors in the field of multidimensional poverty 
measurement based on their contributions. This ranking provides insight into the key researchers 
influencing this area of study. Sabina Alkire is recognized as the leading author in multidimensional 
poverty measurement. Her extensive work and influence in this field suggests that she has significantly 
shaped contemporary discussions and methodologies related to poverty assessment. Following closely 
is Allel Kasim, indicating his substantial contributions to the literature on multidimensional poverty. 
The presence of these top authors highlights the importance of their research in establishing 
foundational theories and frameworks 

The inclusion of Hans-Jürgen Andreß, Gaia Bertarelli, and Gianni Betti among the top five authors 
reflects the diverse perspectives and methodologies being employed in multidimensional poverty 
measurement. Each of these authors may provide unique insights that contribute to a more 
comprehensive understanding of poverty. Authors such as Bahman Cheraghian, Caterina Giusti, and 
Su-Jung Nam further enrich the field with their respective contributions. Their inclusion in the top 
ten signifies that new voices and research are gaining recognition and are potentially shaping future 
directions in multidimensional poverty research. The list represents a variety of scholars from different 
countries, which underscores the global nature of research in multidimensional poverty measurement. 
This geographical diversity may enhance the relevance and applicability of research findings across 
various contexts. 
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Table 2 also summarizes the scientific production related to multidimensional poverty measurement 
across various countries. This data reflects the number of scientific contributions produced by each 
country. The data presented highlights the disparities in scientific production among different 
countries in the field of multidimensional poverty measurement. The USA and the UK are prominent 
contributors, while other countries are beginning to make significant strides. This landscape provides 
an opportunity for collaboration and knowledge exchange, ultimately enhancing the field of 
multidimensional poverty research. Future efforts should focus on understanding the factors that 
contribute to these differences and promoting greater involvement from countries with lower scientific 
output. 

Figure 2. Overlay Visualization of Co-Citation Network 

 

Second, to identify major clusters that represent the core thematic areas, Figure 2 visualizes the co-
citation network among publications in this domain. The central node, "multidimensional poverty," 
underscores the comprehensive nature of recent poverty research, which often adopts frameworks 
like the multidimensional poverty index (MPI) and the capability approach. These frameworks capture 
a range of deprivations beyond income, such as access to education, healthcare, and quality of life. 
This multidimensional approach aligns with Sen’s capability approach, which has been widely adopted 
in poverty studies to argue that well-being encompasses more than just economic measures. The 
prominence of "multidimensional poverty" as a central concept reveals a shift in poverty research from 
unidimensional to more holistic approaches, as advocated by recent studies (D’Amico et al., 2023), 
reflecting an increased awareness of poverty's complexity and its impact on human well -being. 

The green cluster connected to "poverty" and "inequality" also reveals a critical emphasis on how 
poverty and inequality are interwoven. Studies in this cluster highlight the intersection between poverty 
and broader issues including social exclusion, energy poverty, and income inequality. For instance, 
research has shown that low-income populations often face compounded challenges, such as limited 
access to energy, which further deepens poverty and impacts health, education, and economic 
opportunities (Vecchi, 2015). The connection between these themes in the network graph underlines 
the academic consensus that poverty cannot be isolated from other social determinants, such as 
inequality, which reinforces poverty and limits social mobility. This cluster al so highlights regional 
studies, particularly in Europe, which examine social exclusion through poverty indicators and 
emphasize the need for region-specific poverty measurement tools, as illustrated by studies on poverty 
indicators and social exclusion in the European Union context. 
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The red cluster surrounding "deprivation" illustrates a strong link between poverty, health, and 
socioeconomic status. This cluster indicates a growing recognition of the social determinants of health 
within the poverty discourse, as socioeconomic factors including education, income and occupation 
significantly influence health outcomes. Studies linked to this cluster (Li et al., 2023) have shown that 
populations experiencing multidimensional poverty are at greater risk of adverse health outcomes, 
including higher mortality rates and reduced life expectancy. Moreover, the association with terms like 
"COVID-19" highlights the pandemic's exacerbation of existing health and economic inequalities, with 
marginalized populations suffering disproportionately from both the health impacts and economic 
fallout of the crisis. This finding reflects broader discussions in the literature on how health inequities 
and poverty are mutually reinforcing, creating cycles of disadvantage that are dif ficult to break. 

The blue cluster focused on "poverty measurement" and "material deprivation" suggests ongoing 
efforts to refine poverty measurement tools. This cluster reveals an active area of research dedicated 
to improving the precision and relevance of poverty indicators to capture complex realities accurately. 
Scholars have increasingly argued for metrics that capture material deprivation beyond income, 
including access to essential goods and services. The study has emphasized that traditional income-
based poverty measurements fail to reflect the true nature of deprivation (Hamago et al., 2023), 
particularly in contexts where non-monetary aspects of poverty are significant. This focus is critical 
for informing effective policy responses, as governments and organizations rely on accurate poverty 
data to allocate resources and design interventions. The diverse approaches to poverty measurement 
observed in this cluster underscore the complexity of capturing multidimensional poverty and the need 
for innovative metrics tailored to specific contexts. 

Figure 3 reveals the distribution of research documents on multidimensional poverty across several 
academic journals, underscoring the interdisciplinary nature of this research field. Among these, Social 
Indicators Research stands out as the primary contributor with 351 documents, underscoring its 
commitment to social measurements and indicators core elements in multidimensional poverty 
research. This journal's prominence reflects its alignment with poverty research that emphasizes social 
indicators and quality of life measurements (Ramírez et al., 2017). 

Table 3. Most Relevant Sources of Relevant Studies 

 

Following Social Indicators Research, the International Journal of Environmental Research and Public 
Health has a notable number of publications, though fewer in comparison, highlighting the journal's 
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focus on environmental health factors in poverty analysis. This suggests an emerging interest in how 
environmental conditions intersect with poverty, with health considerations playing a critical role in 
understanding poverty's impact on well-being. 

Other journals, such as Sustainability (Switzerland) and Social Science and Medicine, offer a moderate but 
significant number of documents, reflecting a broad interdisciplinary interest that includes social, 
environmental, and health perspectives on poverty. This diversity signals the expanding recognition 
of poverty as a multidimensional issue that intersects with sustainability and public health. Meanwhile , 
journals like PLOS ONE and BMC Public Health show fewer contributions, though their focus on 
public health dimensions highlights the importance of health impacts in understanding poverty's 
broader implications (Carter et al., 2020). 

Specialized journals, including Child Indicators Research and Energy Research and Social Science, 
though representing smaller document counts, emphasize growing scholarly interest in specific aspects 
of multidimensional poverty, such as child poverty and the role of energy access in quality of life. 
These contributions indicate that subfields like child indicators and energy poverty are gaining traction 
in poverty studies, expanding the scope of multidimensional poverty research to include nuanced 
dimensions of deprivation (Notten, 2016). 

Content Analysis 

In exploring the methodologies applied in Multidimensional Poverty Index (MPI) studies, the analysis 
reveals a significant reliance on the Alkire-Foster (AF) method, a prevalent framework in 
multidimensional poverty measurement. The AF method integrates diverse dimensions of deprivation, 
including health, education, and living standards, moving beyond income-centric models to encompass 
broader aspects of well-being. This study identifies these dimensions as consistent elements in MPI 
analyses, closely aligned with international standards (UNDP, 2020). However, substantial variation 
exists across MPI applications, particularly in terms of selected indicators and weighting schemes, 
which are adapted based on regional contexts and data availability. 

For instance, while core dimensions such as health, education, and living standards remain common, 
the specific indicators vary according to study priorities and regional foci. In health, for example, 
indicators like child mortality, nutrition, and healthcare access differ in weight and emphasis depending 
on regional concerns. Similarly, educational indicators range from schooling years to literacy rates, 
shaped by local educational standards and data consistency. Living standards often include access to 
essentials such as clean water, sanitation, electricity, and adequate housing, though some studies 
expand to incorporate employment status or transportation access (Smith et al., 2021). 

The weighting schemes applied also display flexibility, with some studies assigning equal weight across 
dimensions, while others prioritize certain dimensions deemed more critical in a specific context. This 
customization reflects the MPI's adaptability to diverse socio-economic environments but introduces 
subjectivity, as differing weights can substantially affect poverty results and interpretation. This 
variation underscores a core MPI strength its contextual adaptability, yet it also complicates cross study 
comparability, limiting standardization (Zhang et al., 2022). 

Moreover, the analysis highlights a growing trend to include emerging dimensions such as 
environmental sustainability, digital access, and social capital, reflecting evolving perspectives on 
poverty beyond material deprivation. New indicators including environmental quality, internet access, 
and social networks increasingly appear, expanding the MPI’s scope to consider contemporary poverty 
factors and their impact on well-being (Chen, 2020). 

A comparison of methodologies reveals the MPI's unique capability to account for overlapping 
deprivations, offering a more nuanced view of poverty than income-based measures alone. This 
multidimensional lens is invaluable for shaping policies that target specific needs within diverse 
population groups, as it reveals the intersecting factors such as health, education, and living conditions 
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that collectively shape individuals' poverty experiences (Patel et al., 2020). However, MPI frameworks 
face challenges in standardization and data availability, particularly in low-resource contexts, where the 
scarcity of reliable data can necessitate the use of proxies that may not fully represent the targeted 
deprivation. The inherent variability in dimensions and weighting allows for contextualization but also 
hinders the establishment of universal poverty benchmarks, presenting an obstacle for consistent 
cross-country comparisons (Singh et al., 2017). 

Regional Applications and Challenges 

The examination of regional applications and challenges in using the Multidimensional Poverty Index 
(MPI) demonstrates the measure's adaptability and critical role in addressing poverty in diverse 
contexts. Research from regions including Latin America, Sub-Saharan Africa, and South Asia reveals 
significant variations in poverty experiences shaped by distinct economic, social, and cultural factors 
(Martínez-García et al., 2020). These region-specific MPI applications allow for tailored approaches to 
poverty that reflect the most pressing deprivations for each population.  

In Latin America, MPI assessments emphasize social security, housing quality, and education due to 
relatively robust social policies juxtaposed with high inequality and urban poverty. Studies reveal 
substantial disparities between urban and rural areas, with rural populations often facing more severe 
educational and living standard deprivations. Consequently, MPI analyses have been pivotal in 
informing policies aimed at rural infrastructure, quality education access, and healthcare improvements 
(Rodriguez-Alvarez et al., 2021). 

In Sub-Saharan Africa, widespread rural poverty and limited access to essential services pose unique 
challenges. Studies from this region often include dimensions including nutrition, child mortality, and 
water access, crucial in rural and peri-urban areas. However, limited data and irregular updates can 
hinder accurate assessments of these deprivations. Furthermore, selecting feasible yet relevant 
indicators remain a challenge due to inconsistent education data and accessibility issues, though MPI 
insights continue to support interventions in healthcare and rural development (Steinert et al., 2018). 

In South Asia, particularly in densely populated areas like India and Bangladesh, MPI applications 
focus on housing quality, health, and electricity access, all highly pertinent to urban poverty. MPI’s 
ability to capture overlapping deprivations such as inadequate housing, poor sanitation, and 
educational limitations has informed extensive poverty reduction efforts, including large-scale housing 
and sanitation programs (Rahman et al., 2021). 

Despite these insights, regional MPI applications face obstacles, primarily data availability and context -
specific indicator selection. Data collection challenges, financial limitations, and political instability 
often lead to inconsistent poverty measurements across regions. Context-specific indicators are 
essential for accurately capturing regional poverty but add variability that complicates cross-regional 
comparisons (Zhang et al., 2022). Nonetheless, MPI's regional applications have informed targeted 
poverty alleviation strategies by highlighting priority deprivations, supporting initiatives to reduce 
urban inequality in Latin America, guiding health projects in Sub-Saharan Africa, and improving 
housing and sanitation in South Asia. 

Conclusion 

In conclusion, the Multidimensional Poverty Index (MPI) serves as a valuable tool for assessing and 
addressing poverty beyond income-based measures, offering a comprehensive approach that captures 
multiple aspects of deprivation. This study highlights how MPI has been employed across diverse 
regions, including Latin America, Sub-Saharan Africa, and South Asia, to understand the unique 
manifestations of poverty and guide targeted interventions. Through a systematic review of the 
literature and empirical analysis, the adaptability of MPI to regional contexts enables policymakers to 
tailor poverty alleviation efforts to specific needs, from improving rural infrastructure in Sub-Saharan 
Africa to addressing urban inequality in Latin America. 
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However, the application of MPI is not without challenges. Variations in data availability, indicator 
selection, and methodological approaches across regions pose significant barriers to consistent and 
reliable poverty measurement. Particularly in developing countries, limited access to comprehensive 
and updated data can hinder the accuracy of MPI assessments, underscoring the need for enhanced 
data collection and methodological rigor. Addressing these challenges is essential for maximizing 
MPI’s effectiveness in capturing the complexity of poverty. 

Despite these limitations, the MPI has proven instrumental in guiding policies and interventions that  
directly address the lived experiences of the poor. The insights gained from this research underscore 
the importance of a multidimensional perspective in poverty measurement, advocating for continued 
refinement of MPI frameworks and methodologies to enhance their applicability and impact across 
different contexts. Ultimately, the MPI's flexibility and focus on various poverty dimensions provide 
a solid foundation for building poverty reduction strategies that are both comprehensive and regionally 
relevant, contributing to more sustainable progress in global poverty alleviation effort.  
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